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Origin 
This final project of the year was conceived to take place beyond the confines of the studio; 
one reason for this was expedient, as the studio would normally require to be vacated early to 
set up the graduation exhibition; so working away from the studio allowed us to continue on 
rather than have to terminate the project prematurely. Two versions of a common topic: 
‘surveillance of a site’ were created, participants could work with one or the other or between 
the two; the second version ‘Waiting, Watching, Working” was prepared by Rhett Brewer. 

Premise 
The title: ‘Someone might notice a thick puff of smoke (10)’ suggested a ten letter cryptic 
crossword clue, which indeed it was conceived as. The answer to the clue (undisclosed): 
‘camouflage’ linked back to the etymology of the word in reference to ordnance or explosives 
generating smoke, to cover troop movements (camouflet: whiff of smoke in the face), 
anagrammatic clues were also fed into the cryptic mix: ‘Mulgoa Café’, ‘Ace Gum Loaf’ etc; 
The title also alluded to the adage ‘no smoke without fire’; where remaining alert and noticing 
subtle shifts in the appearance of things and circumstance can be beneficial: being observant: 
gaining a fuller understanding of ‘what’s-going-on’, as an ‘early warning system’, sharpening 
ones perceptiveness (as a possible enhancement of aesthetic capability: in noting and 
noticing). 

The project stressed discretion and subtlety of engagement (with the site), doing things that 
would barely be noticed, as a minimal interference, that only the most observant might notice. 
All participants were required to act ‘undercover’ (remain undiscovered) in relation to what 
they were doing. Suspiciousness: ‘acting on suspicion’ was actively encouraged (to discover 
what-was-going-on). Any latent paranoia within the group was dispelled with the ruse of 
espionage actually being played out, (the surveillance and suspicion actual not fanciful, 
everybody was suspect to everybody else). Subtle attempts were made to establish contact 
with third parties whilst remaining undercover: the site becoming a ‘drop off – pick up’ location 
where ‘transferences’ and rendezvous could occur. Each participant had to compile a ‘dossier’ 
which documented all activities, interferences, comings and goings that the surveillance 
noticed. These dossiers were then displayed in a large marquee tent, site maps were issued 
locating all the sites chosen, any of which could then be visited as ‘crime scenes’, as all 
‘cover’ was broken and the ‘smoke screen’ lifted (the dénouement staged as the ‘opening’ of 
the exhibition); everybody was ‘outed’. 

SOMEONE MIGHT NOTICE A THICK PUFF OF SMOKE (10) 

…. is to select a mundane site, situated within an environment of such familiarity that it is 
essentially ‘lost to sight’ – as a situation of humdrum obviousness, memorable only for its 
forgetability and to then subtly alter certain aspects so as to draw attention towards it as a 
‘noticing’ of something that is both odd and inexplicable. The intent, utilising the various tools 
of ingenuity, is to find means to ‘mystify’ mundaneity through teasing out of the various 
threads of intrigue latent within its commonplace ordinance. 

…. With a view to surveillance the chosen site should be conducive to monitoring. A ‘trace 
history’ of its visitation or habitation will need to be carefully documented. There are three 
‘obvious’ domains: 

(1) Sites of transience or transit: tracks, paths, roads, corridors, stairways. 

(2) Sites of occupation: libraries, canteens, offices, bus stops, toilets, studios. 

(3) Sites of impediment or momentary delay: of entrance and exit, into and out of spaces:    
doorways, car parks, lifts, notice boards. 

….for the purposes of the project it is necessary to maintain a clandestine relationship with 
the targeted site such that no suspicion should be aroused in relation to the process of 



surveillance. During the initial stages nothing other than a ‘close watch’ be kept over the site 
and methods devised to document observable occurrences – the investigator acts on 
suspicion – all occurrences need therefore to be considered potentially ‘suspicious’, as 
sources of conjecture within an imaginary fictitious space. 

….having gained a familiarity with the machinations (the comings and goings) of the site, the 
next thing is to consider ways in which the site can be subtly altered at a subliminal level that 
to all intents and purposes will remain unnoticed. The challenge here is to change the site in 
some way without anybody noticing. This minimal intervention should then little by little 
become more explicit, at least to a discerning eye, such that ‘someone might notice 
something unusual.’ 

….it is at this point of engaged inquisitiveness (the lure of enticement) that communication 
can ensue with an unsuspecting audience caught in a state of intrigue as to what will happen 
next….. (the art of instalments). The anonymity of the investigation is paramount throughout 
this exercise, discovery (blowing ones cover) would necessitate abandonment of the chosen 
site and selection of an alternative ‘venue’. 

…. as sites of rendezvous, where items could be left, collected or exchanged in pursuit of the 
paradigm of espionage, the investigator as agent of intrigue intentionally ‘smoke screens’ the 
suspects through the deployment of decoys that operate complicitly with what is counterfeit, 
deceptive and deliberately misleading (as it were conditioned by camouflage). 

….the substantive core of the project resides within the elaborated décor of the suspense it 
maintains, the success of which in part can be measured by the degree to which its intrigue 
imaginatively captures an audience – making an otherwise mundane experience memorable. 
It is only at the conclusion of the project, its dénouement, that the outcome of the surveillance 
is made wholly explicit – as a reportable case study with ‘exhibits’ appropriate to it.  
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